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A T the Court at Kensington, the 7th Day 
**• of August, 1747. 

P R E S E N T , 

The King's most Excellent Majesty in His 
Privy -Council. 

w Hereas John Carbold, of Finingham in 
the County of Suffolk, Labourer ; James 

Morley, of Frandelstone in the said County, 
Carpenter j Thomas Brooks, commonly called 
Bricklayer Tom, of Cotton near Finingham in 
the iaid County, Labourer; Edward Brook, 
of Yackfley in the said County, Butcher; James 
Cunningham, commonly called Curse Mother, 
of Winkfield in the said County, Labourer 5 
Rcbert Cunningham, of the same Place, La­
bourer j Charles Blun field of or near Halftone 
in the laid County, Labourer ; Henry Chittock, 
pf .Stoke near Twaite in the said County, Car­
penter j John Oldous, of Frefingfield in the said 
.County, Labourer ; Robert Clarke, commonly 
called Plunder, of or near Halftone aforesaid, 
In the said County, Labourer; George Potter, 
'otherwise Porter, of Wickham Sky in the said 
County, .Cordwafner j and Thomas Fiflier, of 
Diss in the County of Norfolk, Locksmith ; 
were, upon the Tenth Day of July last, charged 
by Information of a credible Person upon Oath, 
by him subscribed before Thomas Burdus, 
"Esquire, one of hia Majesty's Justices of the 
Peace for tbe County ofMiddlefex, with having 
teen guilty, upon the Fifth Day of September 
last, of being armed with Fire Arms or other 
offensive Weapons, and so armed being all as­
sembled at Feverton in the said County of Suf­
folk, in order to be aiding and assisting in the 
Running and Carrying away uncustomed Goods; 
which Information was afterwards certified by 
the said Thomas Burdus, under his Hand and 
Seal, to one ofhis Majesty's Principal Secretaries 
of Stare, who has laid the fame before his Ma­
jesty in his Privy Council, pursuant to the late 
Act of Parliament of the Nineteenth Year of 
the Reign of his present Majesty, in that Case 
made and provided. His Majesty doth, by 
and with the Advice of his Privy Council, by 
this his Order in his Privy Council, require and 
command, That the said John Carbold, James 
Morley, Thomas Brooks, commonly called 
Bricklayer Tom, Edward Brook, James Cun-
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ningham, commonly called Curse Mother, Ro­
bert Cunningham, Charles Blumfield, Hehry 
Chittock, John Oldous, Robert Clarke, com­
monly called Plunder, George Potter, otherwise 
Porter, and Thomas Fislier, do surrender him­
self and themselves, within the Space of Fort^ 
Days after the first Publication of this Order in 
the London Gazette, to the Lord Chief Justice, 
or one other of his Majesty's Justices of the 
Court of King's Bench, or to one of his Ma­
jesty's Justices of the Peace. 

William Sharpe. 

A T the Court zl Kensington, the 7 th Day of 
** Augufi, 1747* 

P R E S E N T , 

The King's most Excellent Majesty ill His 
Privy Council, 

"XTyHereas William Pollard, otherwise Jere-
** miah Curtis, of Hawkhurst in the Coun­

ty of &ent, Yeoman, ^na jfacoh^Pring, of 
the fame Place, Labourer, were, upon me fio 
venteenth Day of July last, charged by Infor­
mation of a credible Person upon Oath, by him 
subsc ibed before Thomas Burdus, Esquire, one 
of his Majesty's Justices of the Peace for the 
County of Middlesex, with having been guilty, 
upon the Twenty-eighth Day osDecember last, 
of being, together with diverse other Persons, 
armed with Fire-arms or other offensive Wea­
pons, and* so armed, being assembled at Folk­
stone Warren, in the laid County of .Kent, in 
order to be aiding and assisting in the Running, 
Landing, and Carrying away uncustomed 
Goods ; which Information was afterwards 
certified by the said Thoinas Burdus, under his 
Hand and Sea!, to one of his Majesty's Princi­
pal Secretaries of State, who has laid the sataie 
besore his Majesty in his Privy Council, pursu­
ant to. the late Act of Parliament of the Nine­
teenth Year of the Reign of his present Majesty 
in that Cafe made and provided.—His Majesty 

doth, by and with the Advice of his Privy 
Council, by this his Order in his Privy Council, 
require and command, that the faid William 
Pollard, otherwise Jeremiah Curtis, and Jacob 
Pring, and each of them, do surrender himfelf 
and themselves, within the Space of Forty Days Jfr 


